

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 12/06/2019

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 10:01

PS&E JOB NO : 20Z013 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009518 REGION NO : 6
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL5914
 HWY : SR 026
 TITLE : SR 26
 2019-21 ER REGIONWIDE
 BASIC SAFETY - SIGNING REBID
 20Z013
 PROJECT : HSIP-9999(825)
 COUNTY(S) : ADAMS,WHITMAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 5 2020
 AWARDED ON : Feb 11 2020

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
STRIPE RITE, INC. 3117 E FERRY ST SPOKANE WA 992023871 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100194	ROAD PRODUCTS INC. 9915 E TRENT AVE SPOKANE VALLEY, WA 99206-4204 SPOKANE WA 992111072 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100136	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 307 N DAYTON ST KENNEWICK WA 99336-3649 KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
PREPARATION									
1	MOBILIZATION	L.S.			-31.58 %		31.58 %		31.58 %
			9,500.00	6,500.00	-3,000.00	12,500.00	3,000.00	12,500.00	3,000.00
TRAFFIC									
2	PERMANENT SIGNING	L.S.			-15.37 %		-3.78 %		5.90 %
			89,900.00	76,085.00	-13,815.00	86,500.00	-3,400.00	95,200.00	5,300.00
3	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.			64.29 %		121.67 %		94.83 %
			20,300.00	33,350.00	13,050.00	45,000.00	24,700.00	39,550.00	19,250.00
OTHER ITEMS									
4	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE	EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			5.00	5.00		5.00		5.00	
5	MINOR CHANGE	CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			-1.00	-1.00		-1.00		-1.00	
6	SPCC PLAN	L.S.			0.00 %		199.00 %		100.00 %
			500.00	500.00	0.00	1,495.00	995.00	1,000.00	500.00
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$120,204.00</u>	<u>\$116,439.00</u>	<u>-3.13 %</u>	<u>\$145,499.00</u>	<u>21.04 %</u>	<u>\$148,254.00</u>	<u>23.34 %</u>
ALTERNATE A1									
7	MOBILIZATION	L.S.			34.00 %		70.00 %		68.00 %
			2,500.00	3,350.00	850.00	4,250.00	1,750.00	4,200.00	1,700.00
8	PERMANENT SIGNING	L.S.			-0.53 %		6.38 %		26.24 %
			28,200.00	28,050.00	-150.00	30,000.00	1,800.00	35,600.00	7,400.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 12/06/2019

TIME: 10:01

PS&E JOB NO : 20Z013 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009518 REGION NO : 6
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL5914
 HWY : SR 026
 TITLE : SR 26
 2019-21 ER REGIONWIDE
 BASIC SAFETY - SIGNING REBID
 20Z013
 PROJECT : HSIP-9999(825)
 COUNTY(S) : ADAMS,WHITMAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 5 2020

AWARDED ON : Feb 11 2020

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
STRIPE RITE, INC. 3117 E FERRY ST SPOKANE WA 992023871 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100194	ROAD PRODUCTS INC. 9915 E TRENT AVE SPOKANE VALLEY, WA 99206-4204 SPOKANE WA 992111072 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100136	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 307 N DAYTON ST KENNEWICK WA 99336-3649 KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A1									
9	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.							
			5,100.00	14,750.00	189.22 % 9,650.00	16,500.00	223.53 % 11,400.00	16,700.00	227.45 % 11,600.00
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		<u>\$35,800.00</u>	<u>\$46,150.00</u>	28.91 %	<u>\$50,750.00</u>	41.76 %	<u>\$56,500.00</u>	57.82 %
ALTERNATE A2									
10	MOBILIZATION	L.S.							
			5,000.00	4,000.00	-20.00 % -1,000.00	8,000.00	60.00 % 3,000.00	7,865.00	57.30 % 2,865.00
11	PERMANENT SIGNING	L.S.							
			59,400.00	42,775.00	-27.99 % -16,625.00	70,000.00	17.85 % 10,600.00	70,800.00	19.19 % 11,400.00
12	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.							
			8,500.00	16,875.00	98.53 % 8,375.00	25,750.00	202.94 % 17,250.00	31,600.00	271.76 % 23,100.00
	ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL		<u>\$72,900.00</u>	<u>\$63,650.00</u>	-12.69 %	<u>\$103,750.00</u>	42.32 %	<u>\$110,265.00</u>	51.26 %
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$120,204.00</u>	<u>\$116,439.00</u>	-3.13 %	<u>\$145,499.00</u>	21.04 %	<u>\$148,254.00</u>	23.34 %
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$156,004.00</u>	<u>\$162,589.00</u>	4.22 %	<u>\$196,249.00</u>	25.80 %	<u>\$204,754.00</u>	31.25 %
	BASE + A1 + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$228,904.00</u>	<u>\$226,239.00</u>	-1.16 %	<u>\$299,999.00</u>	31.06 %	<u>\$315,019.00</u>	37.62 %

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 12/06/2019

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 10:01

PS&E JOB NO : 20Z013 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009518 REGION NO : 6
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL5914
 HWY : SR 026
 TITLE : SR 26
 2019-21 ER REGIONWIDE
 BASIC SAFETY - SIGNING REBID
 20Z013
 PROJECT : HSIP-9999(825)
 COUNTY(S) : ADAMS,WHITMAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 5 2020
 AWARDED ON : Feb 11 2020

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 FRANK GURNEY, INC.
 5521 E RAILROAD AVE
 99212-0932
 SPOKANE VALLEY WA 99211155'
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 328300

CONTRACTOR NUMBER : CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
PREPARATION									
1	MOBILIZATION	L.S.			-21.05 %				-100.00 %
			9,500.00	7,500.00	-2,000.00	0.00			
TRAFFIC									
2	PERMANENT SIGNING	L.S.			20.83 %				-100.00 %
			89,900.00	108,625.00	18,725.00	0.00			
3	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.			183.25 %				-100.00 %
			20,300.00	57,500.00	37,200.00	0.00			
OTHER ITEMS									
4	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE	EST.			0.00 %				0.00 %
			5.00	5.00		0.00			
5	MINOR CHANGE	CALC			0.00 %				0.00 %
			-1.00	-1.00		0.00			
6	SPCC PLAN	L.S.			60.00 %				-100.00 %
			500.00	800.00	300.00	0.00			
			<hr/>						
	BASE TOTAL		\$120,204.00	\$174,429.00	45.11 %				%
ALTERNATE A1									
7	MOBILIZATION	L.S.			-48.00 %				-100.00 %
			2,500.00	1,300.00	-1,200.00	0.00			
8	PERMANENT SIGNING	L.S.			41.84 %				-100.00 %
			28,200.00	40,000.00	11,800.00	0.00			

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 12/06/2019

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 10:01

PS&E JOB NO : 20Z013 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009518 REGION NO : 6
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL5914
 HWY : SR 026
 TITLE : SR 26
 2019-21 ER REGIONWIDE
 BASIC SAFETY - SIGNING REBID
 20Z013
 PROJECT : HSIP-9999(825)
 COUNTY(S) : ADAMS,WHITMAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 5 2020
 AWARDED ON : Feb 11 2020

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 FRANK GURNEY, INC.
 5521 E RAILROAD AVE
 99212-0932
 SPOKANE VALLEY WA 99211155'
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 328300

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A1									
9	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.			213.73 %				-100.00 %
			5,100.00	16,000.00	10,900.00	0.00			
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		<u>\$35,800.00</u>	<u>\$57,300.00</u>	60.06 %				
ALTERNATE A2									
10	MOBILIZATION	L.S.			-48.00 %				-100.00 %
			5,000.00	2,600.00	-2,400.00	0.00			
11	PERMANENT SIGNING	L.S.			26.26 %				-100.00 %
			59,400.00	75,000.00	15,600.00	0.00			
12	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.			197.65 %				-100.00 %
			8,500.00	25,300.00	16,800.00	0.00			
	ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL		<u>\$72,900.00</u>	<u>\$102,900.00</u>	41.15 %				
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$120,204.00</u>	<u>\$174,429.00</u>	45.11 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$156,004.00</u>	<u>\$231,729.00</u>	48.54 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE + A1 + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$228,904.00</u>	<u>\$334,629.00</u>	46.19 %	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE		NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 20Z013

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 009518

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Feb 5 2020

TITLE: SR 26

2019-21 ER REGIONWIDE

BASIC SAFETY - SIGNING REBID

20Z013

REGION: 6

HWY: SR 026

1	BASE + A1	STRIPE RITE, INC. 3117 E FERRY ST SPOKANE, WA 992023871
2	BASE + A1	FRANK GURNEY, INC. 5521 E RAILROAD AVE 99212-0932 PO BOX 11557 SPOKANE VALLEY, WA 992111557
3	BASE + A1	ROAD PRODUCTS INC. 9915 E TRENT AVE SPOKANE VALLEY, WA 99206-4204 PO BOX 11072 SPOKANE, WA 992111072
4	BASE + A1	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA PAVEMENT SURFACE CONTROL 307 N DAYTON ST KENNEWICK WA 99336-3649 PO BOX 7204 KENNEWICK, WA 993360616
5	BASE + A1 + A2	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA PAVEMENT SURFACE CONTROL 307 N DAYTON ST KENNEWICK WA 99336-3649 PO BOX 7204 KENNEWICK, WA 993360616
6	BASE + A1 + A2	ROAD PRODUCTS INC. 9915 E TRENT AVE SPOKANE VALLEY, WA 99206-4204 PO BOX 11072 SPOKANE, WA 992111072
7	BASE + A1 + A2	FRANK GURNEY, INC. 5521 E RAILROAD AVE 99212-0932 PO BOX 11557 SPOKANE VALLEY, WA 992111557

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 20Z013

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 009518

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Feb 5 2020

TITLE: SR 26

2019-21 ER REGIONWIDE

BASIC SAFETY - SIGNING REBID

20Z013

REGION: 6

HWY: SR 026

8

BASE + A1 + A2

STRIPE RITE, INC.

3117 E FERRY ST

SPOKANE, WA 992023871